2024-34 TRANSPORTATION SERVICES - BID TABULATION

January 23, 2025 @ 11:00AM

VENDOR

ARC Glow

First Choice Ride Services

Medical Motor Service of
Rochester and Monroe
County

Quality Transportation
Group

Start and end times for Monday - Friday

7:00AM-5:00PM

6:00AM-6:00PM (After hours
until 12AM)

7:00AM-8:00PM

7:30AM-8:30PM

Start and end times for weekends

Saturday - 10:00AM-7:00PM

No Bid Sunday - 11:00AM-10:00PM 7:00AM-8:00PM 7:00AM-8:00PM
(After hours until 12AM)
Guaranteed Response Time in hours M-F Less than 36 hrs notice = 2
4 Hrs 1 Hour Hours More than 36 hrs 15-20 Minutes
notice= 45 Minutes
Guaranteed Response Time in hours weekends Less than 36 hrs notice = 2
No Bid 2 Hours Hours More than 36 hrs 1 Hour
notice= 45 Minutes
Per Mile Rate
- $3.00/Mile $4.00/Mile none
Livery rate 20.00 Load Rate + Per Mil
v $2.80/ mile (load mile) No Bid 2 oa Raztaee eriviie $140.80 per trip
Wheelchair rate 50.00 Load Rate + Per Mile
$3.45 (load mile) No Bid 2 ! No Bid
Rate
Door through door rate 40.00 Load Rate + Per Mil
& No additional Charge $20.00 + Per Mile Rate 2 oa Raztaee eriviie $153.60 Per trip
Group rate (5< 30/person, $45 per SUV seats 5 pass $153.60 per
P (5<) $3.45 (load mile) $25.00 + Per Mile Rate >30/p $. P P . > P
wheelchair trip
Stretcher rate . . $200.00 Load Rate + Per Mile .
No Bid No Bid Rate No Bid

Trip Rate (1-way) or pick up fee

$15 for Livery / $30 for
Wheelchair

$25.00 + Per Mile Rate

Outlined above

$140.80 Per trip

On-Demand: Any scheduled trip with less than
36-hour notice

No additional Charge

$35.00 + Per Mile Rate

No additional Charge

$153.60 Per trip

Fixed Schedule: Any scheduled trip with

greater than 36-hour notice No Bid Per Mile Rate No additional Charge $140.80 Per trip
i i i MMS i 14 j
Guaranteed Response Time in hours Holidays . . recogmze:s maljor 1-2 hours for on call, if not pre-
No Bid 2.5 Hours holidays, otherwise outlined

above

arranged

Cancellation Fee

Based on Fee Schedule

Based on Fee Schedule

Based on Fee Schedule

Based on Fee Schedule

Addendum

Attachment D

Non - Collusion

Signed bid
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