2024- 20 Cleaning and Paper Products Bid Tabulation

9/17/2024
Vendor NYSID POB Precision Services Heels Safety Supplies Economy Products Spruse Home Inc ConServ Company Unipak Corp Plastic Express Inc Sanico Inc Pyramid School Products |Cultured Supply LLC| Staples Contract & [C.W. Nowlin Enterprises| Hill & Marks LLC Central Poly Bag | Interboro Packaging Bid| Interboro Packaging | Interboro Packaging | Interboro Packaging | Interboro Packaging
LLC DBA Mayo Clean Commercial LLC LLC Corp A Bid B Bid C Bid D BidE
Min. Amt: Min. Amt: $0 Min. Amt: $250 Min. Amt:$150.00 Min. Amt: $100 Min. Amt: $0 Min. Amt: $0 Min. Amt: $1500.00 Min. Amt: $100.00 Min. Amt: $50.00 Full Min. Amt:$507.12 Min. Amt:$35 Min. Amt: $0 Min. Amt: $350.00 Min. Amt: $500 Min. Amt: $0 Min. Amt: $0 Min. Amt: $0 Min. Amt: $0 Min. Amt: $0
Cases Onlv.
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty | CURRENT | Phkge. Size [ Unit Pkge. Size [ Unit Price | Pkge. Size | Unit Price | Pkge. Size [Unit Price| Pkge. Size | Unit Price | Pkge.Size | Unit Price | Pkge. Size | Unit Price | Pkge. Size | Unit Price | Pkge. Size | Unit Price [ Pkge.Size | Unit Price | Pkge. Size | Unit Price | Pkge. Size Unit Pkge. Size Unit Pkge. Size [ Unit | Pkge. Size Unit Pkge. Size | Unit Price | Pkge. Size | Unit Price | Pkge. Size | Unit Price | Pkge. Unit Price| Pkge. Size | Unit Price
CASE SIZE Price Price Price Price Price
Air Freshener, fan cartridge style, Citrus [ 10 6les 6lcase $489.37 No Bid No Bid 6Blcase $14.60 No Bid No Bid |48 ml-6/case | $98.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or Cherry (Impact 30 day)
No Bid
Air Freshener, Gel 2 oz. (Refresh 2.0 2 12/box 12/box $44.70 12/Box $37.25 No Bid 12/box 3.16/per 12/box $45.89 NoBid | 20z-12/box | $49.73 No Bid | 40z, 12/box, 6 | 30.73/box NoBid [BX112-(20z)| $31.74 No Bid 12/BX $49.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cherry) No Bid freshener box/case
Armor All protectant spray 6 $20.55 6/Carton $89.32 No Bid 6lcase 12.31/bottle | 320z Each $13.89 NoBid |10 0z - 12/case| $64.32 No Bid 280z - Blcase | 10.99/bottle NoBid [EA11-(2802) | $12.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid
Bag, Kraft #10 LB, (large brown paper | 4 500/bundle 500/bundle $47.93 500/Bundle $34.75 400/bd! $16.54 | 500/bundle .03/bag 500/bundle $16.89 No Bid 500/bundle $37.49 | 500/bundle |  $17.94 No Bid No Bid PK/500 $29.45 No Bid 500/BL $18.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
lunch bags) No Bid
Bleach (Pure Bright) 25 6/1gal 6/1gal $60.67 6/Case $48.77 4les $17.99 6/1 gal 4.41/gal 6/1gal $26.89 No Bid 6/1 gal $30.12 No Bid 1gal - 6lcase $31.99 No Bid CT/6 (GAL) | $29.99 | 1Lx4=gallon | $56.86 | 6/1GL/CS | $29.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6/1 gallon case
No Bid
Bowl, 5 oz. plastic 10 800/cs No Bid 800/case $609.64 800/cs $144.34 No Bid 1000/case .02 each 1000/case $59.89 No Bid 1000/case $164.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid PK/125 $15.70 No Bid 1000/CS | $58.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bowl, foam, 12 0z 10 1000/cs 1000/case $47.35 125/Pack, $42.60 1000 $46.45 | 1000/case .05 each 1000/case $52.89 No Bid 1000/case $29.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT/1000 $38.97 No Bid | 1000/CS | $68.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 Packs/Carton
No Bid
Broom, large angle 12 12/cs No Bid No Bid 12/Pack $187.92 6 prics 47.94/cs 12/case 6.83 ea 12/case $184.89 No Bid 12/case $236.03 each $10.30 12/case $48.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid LEA $8.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Car/vehicle wash 6 NoBid $7.82 No Bid 5gal $36.23 | 640z - 4/case| 7.02 each each $10.59 No Bid [ 1000z - 4/case | $37.11 5 gal $43.00 No Bid No Bid ct14-(640z) | $25.88 | 1Lx4=gallon | $12.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
o Bi
Carrying tray, Kraft 9 3/8" x 6 5/8" 500 250/case 1.49 each No Bid 250 $55.89 No Bid 100/cs 10" X | $78.89 No Bid 250/case $63.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | 10"x6"x2", | $62.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid tray 578" 250/CS
Cleaner, Degreaser, Aerosol 20 oz. 3 12fes 12/case $106.03 12/Carton $67.00 12 $25.83 12/case 3.49 each No Bid No Bid |200z - 12/case| $55.40 200z - $45.12 12/case $40.95 No Bid ct16- (190z) | $16.00 1L 12/case $17.38 | 12/2002/CS | $68.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
cans No Bid 12/case
Cleaner, Disinfectant, Aerosol foaming, | 3 12fes 12/case $143.00 12/Carton $63.11 12 $29.64 12/case 3.92 each 12fes $54.89 No Bid 240z - 12/case| $46.78 200z - $43.80 12/case $33.98 No Bid ct16-(190z) | $16.41 | 16.6 0z 12/case | $13.17 | 12/240z/CS | $57.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
200z, No Bid 12/case
Cleaner, Industrial Drain Digest Enzyme| 3 4/1gal 4glics $64.66 4/1 gal $92.15 4/Carton $74.76 4x1 $30.68 401 gal $13.08 4/1 gal $72.89 No Bid | 1gal-4/case | $59.99 4 gallcase $36.80 No Bid No Bid ct16- (190z) | $48.55 No Bid | 4/1GL/CS | $37.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleaner, Glass, 20 oz. spray cans (One | 5 12/case No Bid $98.50 12/Carton $58.02 12 $37.41 12/case 2.93 each 12fes $39.89 No Bid 12/case $47.89 200z - $38.88 12/case $29.20 No Bid ct16- (190z) | $17.65 1L12fcs $17.38 | 12/1902/CS | $52.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Swipe) 12/case
Cleaner, Oven and Grill 2 12fes No Bid $209.76 12/Carton $66.52 12 $40.23 12/case 4.94 each 12fes $64.89 No Bid 12/case $67.68 180z - $46.80 12/case $38.99 Gallon | 21.13/Gal | ct16-(190z) | $38.52 No Bid | 12/190z/CS | $77.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12/case
Cleaner, Stainless Steel, Aerosol 20 0z. | 7 12/cs No Bid $151.32 No Bid 12 $31.65 | 12/case | 3.78each 12/cs $50.59 No Bid 12/case $76.10 200z - $64.80 12/case $33.78 NoBid | ct16-(1%z) | $22.18 No Bid | 12/160z/CS | $76.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cans 12/case
Cleaner, Toilet Bowl, High Acid, quarts [ 1 12fes No Bid $91.90 12/Carton $60.10 12 $32.00 12/case 3.99 each No Bid No Bid 12/case $43.99 [ 12qrsicase |  $23.28 No Bid NoBid [ CT112-(Qt) | $28.06 IL12/cs $17.38 | 12/3202/CS | $27.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Simoniz)
Cleanser, All Purpose Neutral (AP-7), 6 4/ gal cs 4glics $66.65 $77.57 No Bid 4xt $21.33 4gallcase 7.60 each No Bid No Bid 4lcase $44.24 4 gals/case $22.60 No Bid NoBid | CT14-(Gal) | $53.69 |1Lx4=gallon| $50.54 | 4/1GL/CS | $24.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Germicidal 4gallon Case
Cleanser, Scouring Powder, 14 oz. 2 24lcs No Bid $90.24 No Bid 24/cs $33.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid |21oz-24/case| $42.08 2loz- $45.60 | 210z - 24/case $36.98 No Bid CT124- $41.92 No Bid | 24/210z/CS | $40.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Babo) 24/case (2102)
Cleanser, All Purpose Spray (lysol or 10 No Bid 320z $5.49 No Bid 12/200z $33.00 12/case 3.92 each each $7.89 No Bid |320z-12/case| $67.90 No Bid |20 0z - 12/case $33.99 NoBid | EAI1(190z) | $10.05 | 16.60z12/cs | $13.17 | 12/2402/CS | $60.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equivalent)
Cups, 8 0z hot/cold without handles 15 1000/cs 1000/cs $66.20 $127.87 1000/Case $61.86 1000 37.40 /cs | 1000/case .03 each 1000/cs $32.59 No Bid |50 per sleeve -|  $48.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT /500 $32.49 No Bid 1000/CS | $47.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 sleevelcase
Cups, 12 oz hot/cold without handles 500 1000/cs $89.69 500/case $1.25 1000/Case $61.49 500 $54.46 1000/case $0.04 1000/cs $46.89 No Bid |50 per sleeve -|  $72.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT /500 $35.21 No Bid 1000/CS | $64.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 sleevelcase
Cups, Hot 8 oz. 46 1000/cs 1000/cs $66.20 $49.55 1000/Case $61.86 1000 $39.48 1000/case .03 each 1000/cs $32.59 No Bid |50 per sleeve -|  $69.83 1000/cs $68.90 No Bid No Bid CT /500 $25.73 No Bid 1000/CS | $47.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 sleevelcase
Cup Lids for 8 0z hot/cold 16 1000/cs No Bid $129.35 1000/Case $68.11 1000 $31.20 1000/case .02 each 1000/cs. $38.89 No Bid 1000/case $43.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT /500 $17.51 No Bid 1000/CS | $36.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cups, translucent plastic, 50z 2 2500/cs No Bid $85.71 [1000/Sleeve 25  $63.60 2500 $105.25 | 2500/case .02 each 2500/cs. $45.89 No Bid |100 per sleeve | $58.67 2500/cs $35.60 2500/case $51.99 No Bid CT /2500 $89.88 No Bid 2500/CS $57.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sleeves/Carton 25 sleeve/case
Dish Detergent, (Emerald Green / 30 4 gallcs. No Bid $45.98 4/Case $105.11 4x1 $20.62 4gallcase $21.42 4 galles $84.89 NoBid | 1gal-4/case | $99.03 4 galles $23.40 No bid No Bid NoBid |1Lx4=gallon| $63.18 | 4/1GL/CS | $89.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawn) 4fgallon Case
Dish Detergent, Dawn or Ajax 10 No Bid 56 0z $11.67 No Bid NoBid | 4galicase $13.57 700z $13.59 NoBid | 1gal-4/case | $89.07 4 gallcs $79.40 | 240z-3fcase | 5.99/hottle No Bid EAL-(Gal) | $24.66 |1Lx4=gallon| $1580 | 8/3802/CS | $61.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dish Washing Gloves- med 10 No Bid $13.12 12 pair $30.72 No Bid No bid $8.59 No Bid | 12 pairs/case $25.58 12pair/pkg $9.60 12 pair/box .66/pair No Bid DZ /12 - (15 $6.88 No Bid 12/PK $10.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
mil thick & 12"
lenath)
Dish Washing Gloves - Large 10 No Bid $8.22 No Bid No Bid No bid $8.59 NoBid | 12pairscase | $25.58 | 12pairipkg $9.60 12 pair/box .66/pair No Bid DZ /12 - (15 $6.88 No Bid 12/PK $10.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
mil thick & 12"
lenath)
Dish Washing Gloves - XL 10 No Bid $5.02 No Bid No Bid No bid $8.59 No Bid | 12 pairsicase $25.58 12pairfpkg $9.60 12 pair/box .66/pair No Bid DZ /12 - (15 $6.88 No Bid 12/PK $10.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
mil thick & 12"
lenath)
Disinfectant Spray, 19 0z Can (Lysol) | 5 12/cs No Bid $180.61 No Bid NoBid | 12icase | 9.27each 12/cs $124.89 No Bid | 190z- 12/case| $129.31 200z - $33.36 | 200z- 12/case |  $33.99 No Bid No Bid | 16.60z12/cs | $13.17 | 12/1902/CS | $136.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12/case
Disinfectant Wipes 12 6 $80.75 | 75 count each $5.74 No Bid No Bid 6lcase 5.57 each | 6"x63/4" $8.59 No Bid 80 $37.60 |6tubsof 75 | $22.50 35/tub - 12 3.89/tub No Bid PK/80 - $4.95 No Bid | 6/75ct/CS | $25.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
canisters/cs 240 Count wpies/canister Jcase tubslcase (Lemon &
Disinfectant 6 canister/case Lime)
Wipes 12
Lemon Scent
Dust Mop Frame, snap on 48" x 5" 3 each No Bid $37.78 No Bid No Bid each $8.94 $15.89 No Bid each $14.99 $5.90 6lcase 7.50/each No Bid EA/1 $5.31 No Bid LUEA $5.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dust Mop, cotton, 48" x 5" 6 Sles No Bid l/case $186.56 No Bid No Bid each $18.43 $32.89 No Bid 5lcase $83.85 $11.10 Slcase $39.95 No Bid EA/1 $7.10 No Bid LUEA $9.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Facial Tissue, 2-ply (Kleenex) 4 30 boxfcs 30bx/cs $28.91 $99.53 100 Sheets/ $38.36 3/ $21.00 36boxes/ 1.75 box 36box/cs $72.89 No Bid 100/box - $31.82 [ 30 boxesof | $18.30 30 box/case $25.99 No Bid | ct/36-(3600 | $47.70 No Bid | 30 BOX/CS | $22.50 | 300/100/cs | $26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Box, 30 Boxes/ case 30/case 100/case Sheets)
Carton
Floor machine pads: polish 20" white 30 Sles Sles $26.00 $54.22 5/Carton $40.49 Sles $18.92 Slcase 4.13 each Sles $29.89 No Bid Slcase $48.45 Slcase $13.95 Slcase $13.79 No Bid ct/5 $17.98 No Bid 5/CS $19.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Floor machine pads: primer 20" red 20 Sles Sles $28.64 $40.84 5/Carton $40.49 Sles $18.92 Slcase 4.13 each Sles $29.89 No Bid Slcase $48.45 Slcase $13.95 Slcase $13.79 No Bid ct/5 $17.98 No Bid 5/CS $19.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Floor machine pads: stripper 20" black 20 5qal Sles $33.29 $40.17 5/Carton $40.15 Sles $18.92 Slcase 5.67 each Sles $29.89 No Bid Slcase $48.45 5 case $13.95 Slcase $13.79 No Bid ct/5 $17.98 No Bid 5/CS $19.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Floor polish, high solids, high traffic, 8 5qal 5gal $143.25 $207.35 5Gal $121.82 5gal $59.96 5gal $196.29 5 Gal $94.89 No Bid 5gal $121.14 5gal $78.95 No Bid No Bid ea/l-(5gal) | $80.28 No Bid | 5 GALLON | $93.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
high gloss
Floor Soap, Germicidal Citrus, 1 Gallon | 10 4les No Bid $116.08 No Bid 4x1 $26.07 4gallcase | 10.05 each 4les $129.89 No Bid 4case $81.39 4fcase $27.80 No Bid No Bid ct 14- (Gal) $42.06 1L 4fcase $14.22 | 41GL/ICS | $47.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Lemon Quat)
Floor wax stripper, heavy duty 3 4glics $85.98 $66.24 No Bid No Bid 4galfcase | 14.41 each 5 Gal $59.89 No Bid 1 galleach $34.82 5gal $51.20 No Bid No Bid EAL (5 Gal $73.33 No Bid | 4/1GL/CS | $46.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bib)
Foil, aluminum, 18"x500', heavy duty 7 1rlfes No Bid $35.60 Each $56.86 rl $49.09 each $48.77 1rlfes $27.89 No Bid each $49.99 Lroll/case $30.80 No Bid No Bid eall $40.46 No Bid 1RL $30.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foil, sheets 9x10 500 No Bid 500/box 1.08 each 500/Box $13.58 No Bid 500box - $0.02 500 Sheets/ $15.59 No Bid 500/box $32.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT/3000 $97.85. No Bid | 12/200/CS | $51.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
sheet 6boxes/ bx
case
Foil bags, 3 1/2" x 1 1/2" (for hot dogs) | 500 No Bid 250/case 1.10 per No Bid No Bid 1000 ct $0.08 1000/cs. $51.89 No Bid 1000/case $64.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid BX/500 $117.49 No Bid 1000/CS | $67.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
bag




Gloves, Latex, size XL, powder free, 30 100bag/10cs No Bid $16.52 1,000/Carton $66.24 No Bid 1000/case $0.04 100bag/10cs [ $35.59 100/10 $48.90 6 pairs/case $20.05 | 100 per box $3.90 100bag/10cs $56.90 No Bid | ct/1000- finger | $6.12 No Bid | 10/100/CS | $47.29 No Bid 100/case $37.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
“Kitchen use" Thickness 3mil
Palm thickness
4mil
Gloves, Nitrile, size M, powder free 2 100/bx 10bxsles | $47.51 $19.66 100/Box $6.25 NoBid | 100/box $0.04 100/bx $5.50 100/box $4.75 | 100box-10 [ $48.99 [100perbox| $3.65 100/bx 3.94/box No Bid | ct/1000- finger | $6.12 NoBid | 100BX | $6.00 NoBid [ 100/Box $2.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
boxes/case Thickness 3mil
Palm thickness
4mil
Gloves, Nitrile, size L, powder free 35 100/bx 10bxslcs | $47.51 $18.12 100/Box $6.25 No Bid 100/box $0.04 100/bx $5.59 100/box $4.75 100/box - 10 $48.99 | 100 per box $3.65 100/bx 3.94/box No Bid [ ct/1000- finger | $6.12 No Bid 100/BX $6.00 No Bid 100/Box $2.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
boxeslcase Thickness 3mil
Palm thickness
4mil
Gloves, Nitril, size XL, powder free 25 100/box 10bxsles | $47.51 $19.42 100/Box $6.25 NoBid | 100/box $0.06 100/bx $5.50 100/box $4.75 | 100box-10 | $48.99 |[100perbox| $3.65 100/bx 3.94/box No Bid | ct/1000- finger | $6.12 NoBid | 100BX | $6.00 NoBid | 100/Box $2.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
boxes/case Thickness 3mil
Palm thickness
4mil
Gloves, Vinyl, size M, powder free, 58 1,000/cs 10bxslcs | $30.80 $123.02 1000/cs $37.49 No Bid 1000/case $0.03 1000/cs. $23.59 1000/case $27.50 100/box - 10 $49.99 1000/case $22.60 10/100/case $29.50 No Bid [ ct/1000- finger [ $26.99 No Bid | 10/100/CS | $21.23 No Bid | 1000/case $21.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
“Kitchen use" boxeslcase &palm
Thickness :3mil
Gloves, Vinyl, size L, powder free, 15 1,000/cs 10bxslcs | $30.80 $116.87 1000/cs $49.99 No Bid 1000/case $0.03 1000/cs. $23.59 1000/case $27.50 100/box - 10 $49.99 1000/case $22.60 10/100/case $29.50 No Bid [ ct/1000- finger [ $26.99 No Bid | 10/100/CS | $21.23 No Bid | 1000/case $21.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
“Kitchen use" boxeslcase &palm
Thickness :3mil
Gloves, Vinyl, size XL, powder free, 45 1,000/cs 10bxslcs | $30.80 $123.02 1000/cs $49.99 No Bid 1000/case $0.03 1000/cs. $23.59 1000/case $27.50 100/box - 10 $49.99 1000 case $22.60 10/100/case $29.50 No Bid [ ct/1000- finger [ $26.99 No Bid | 10/100/CS | $21.23 No Bid | 1000/case $21.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
“Kitchen use" boxes/case &palm
Thickness :3mil
Hairnets, light brown 1 144/cs No Bid $58.78 No Bid 144/cs $26.10 No Bid 100/cs $6.59 No Bid 144/case $60.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 144/BX $13.64 No Bid 144/box $19.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hand cleaning wipes (similar to scrubs | 18 6Blcs No Bid $35.63 72/Bucket, 6 | $119.46 No Bid 6lcase 15.91 each 6les $89.89 No Bid | 72/bucket-6 | $89.99 No Bid T2/bucket - $106.99 No Bid PK/1-(72per | $15.95 No Bid 6/CS $96.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ina bucket) Buckets/Carton bucket/case 6lcase bucket)
Hand Sanitizer Cartridges, Antibacterial | 5 6/1000 ML No Bid $95.66 6/Case $79.36 No Bid NoBid | 6/1000ML | $49.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | CT/6-1000ML | $69.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gel, Alcohol Free (Aquacil Foaming)
Hand Sanitizer Cartridges, Antibacterial | 21 12/800 ML No Bid $196.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gel, Alcohol Free (Enopac)
Hand Sanitzer (Dermagel Grn Sanitiz) 4 gal No Bid | 4/case Inopak $41.71 Gal $32.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1gal -6lcase | 29.98/gal No Bid CT/4 -GAL $78.43 | 135fl.oz. X3 | $12.11 | 4/1GL/ICS | $68.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
=1L 4L=gallon
Hand soap cartridges, enriched lotion 20 12/800 ML No Bid 4lcase $190.27 12/Case $68.29 No Bid No Bid 12/800ML. $68.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12/800 ML $40.99 No Bid |CT/12-800ML | $53.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hand soap cartridges, Foaming Blue 15 [ 6/1000 ML No Bid $82.93 No Bid No Bid NoBid | 6/1000ML | $48.89 No Bid No Bid NoBid | 6/1000 ML $50.99 No Bid | CT/6 1000ML | $51.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hand Wash (Inopak)
Hand soap, liquid, enriched lotion 11 2 gallcs dglics | $45.62 $80.22 No Bid ax1 $22.00 No Bid 4 gallcs $41.89 NoBid | 1gal-4fcase | $87.68 No Bid 4 gallcs $48.79 NoBid | CTA-GAL | $44.39 | 85fl.0z. X 16 | $160.06 | 4/GLICS | $30.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
=gal 4 gallcs
Hand soap cartridges, pumice 5 | 42000ML [ 4/2000ml | $79.38 $100.39 4/Carton $101.03 No Bid NoBid | 4/2000ML | $86.89 No Bid 2000mi - $78.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid | CT/4 2000ML | $67.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
alcase
Laundry Soap 2 50 Ib/box No Bid $77.41 50lb/bx $71.10 50 Ib box $29.37 40lb/ $31.69 50Ib/box $49.89 No Bid 50lb/box $91.48 50Ib $27.90 No Bid No Bid EA/L50LB $28.96 | 6.6lbs. X8= $61.51 | 50LB BOX | $32.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
bucket BOX 52.8lhs
Lime Scale Remover 12 4/16 0z No Bid 41200z $56.14 No Bid 4x1 $29.60 320z/12/ 5.02 each 41160z $38.89 No Bid | 1gal-6/case | $68.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT/12320Z | $57.40 1L 4fcase $17.38 | 1/EA 280z | $7.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
case
Mop Handle, for mop head below 53 each No Bid 2lcase $13.37 Each $2.23 ea $8.99 each $6.04 each $5.89 No Bid each $17.18 No Bid 12eachicase 5.99 each No Bid EAL $12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mop Head, lay flat, 20 oz. (must screw | 615 each No Bid 12/case $12.39 Each $6.88 ea $5.56 each (240z) $6.82 each $4.59 No Bid 12/case $8.99 No Bid 12eachicase 3.98 each No Bid EAIL $7.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
into handle)
Mop Head, medium weight 10 1each No Bid $13.81 Each $6.88 ea $5.99 each (160z) $5.52 each $7.59 No Bid 12/case $11.99 $3.75 12eachicase 2.79 each No Bid EA/L $4.99 No Bid 1EA $3.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Napkins, white paper fold 1/4, 1 ply 6 6000/cs 6000/cs | $55.08 $69.67 | 6.000/Carton | $56.35 | 6000kcs | $36.75 | 6000/case $0.01 6000/cs $34.89 NoBid | 6000kcase | $40.63 | 6000fcase | $53.50 No Bid No Bid CT/4000 | $33.37 NoBid | 6000/CS | $43.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Paper bags, popcorn, 20z 500 No Bid 1.13 each | 2,000/Carton $67.49 No Bid 36/case 1.01 each 2000/cs. $49.89 No Bid 2000/case $64.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid BX/1000 $32.53 No Bid | 1000/CS, | $48.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4'%1.5"x8"
Paper Towels, white roll, Y-notch NP- | 60 6les No Bid 800, 6/case $16.77 | 6 Rolls/ Carton |  $63.46 6les $40.78 6lcase 9.01 each 6lcs $52.89 No Bid 6Blcase $52.82 6Blcase $42.20 No Bid No Bid CT/6 $38.39 No Bid No Bid 6/800'cs $36.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6800YW 7.9 x 800"
Paper Towels, C-Fold 24 2400/cs $28.98 2400 $31.42 200/Pack 12 $49.30 2400/cs $24.67 12pkfet 1.97 each 2400/cs. $25.59 No Bid 12/case $39.72 2400/case $26.50 No Bid No Bid CT/2400 $34.63 No Bid | 12/198/CS | $31.17 2400/cs $29.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
sheets/case Packs/ Carton
Paper Towels, rolled, brown, 8" wide x | 12 12/cs No Bid $48.37 12 Rolls/ $44.50 | 600'12/65 [ $24.00 12/case 2.40 each 12fcs $26.89 No Bid 12/case $42.37 12/case $25.20 No Bid No Bid cTn2 $30.39 No Bid 12/Cs $28.16 | 12/3507cs | $30.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3501, 2” core Carton
Paper Towels, White Multi-fold 225 4000/cs 4000/cs $33.52 $107.04 | 250 sht/pk, 16 |  $32.51 530 $25.03 4000/case $0.01 4000/cs $27.59 No Bid | 250/pack - 16 |  $56.82 4000/case $20.90 No Bid No Bid CT/4000 $30.44 No Bid 4000/CS $26.91 4000/cs $34.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
pkics 4000/cs packsicase
Paper Towels, white roll, 70 sheets per | 600 30 rlfes 30rl/es $39.60 $49.11 70/ Roll, $45.48 30/85 $25.93 [ 85sheets/30 | 1.28 each 30rlfes $24.59 No Bid 85/roll - 30 $45.80 30/case $22.10 No Bid No Bid CT/30-2550 | $31.86 No Bid |30RL/B5SHE| $28.05 30/85/cs $36.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
roll, 2ply 30Rolls Carton case rolls/case SHEETS 8.X11 ET/CS
Plastic Wrap, 18"x2000' 8 1rlies No Bid $74.49 Roll $39.99 No Bid 1 roll/case $23.26 Lrlles $16.59 No Bid 1 roll/case $29.99 Ucase $17.80 No Bid No Bid RL/L $43.99 No Bid $17.63 1Roll $33.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Plate, paper, white 6", uncoated 10 500/cs No Bid $33.16 500/Cs $18.56 No Bid 100/pk - 02 each 1000/cs. $33.89 No Bid | 100/pack -10 | $27.74 1000/case. $18.20 No Bid No Bid CT/1000 $19.29 No Bid | 10/100/CS | $15.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10pklcase packs/case
Plates, styrofoam 10" 13 500/cs No Bid $80.69 125/Pack, 4 $48.62 No Bid 500/case 074 each 500/cs $52.89 No Bid | 125/pack-4 | $39.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT/500 $43.15 No Bid 500/CS $66.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Packs/ Carton packs/case
Pledge, multi surface cleaner, 9.7 0z 15 No Bid 9.7 0z $7.44 6/Carton $56.24 No Bid 6lcase 6.40 each each $6.59 NoBid |9.70z-6/case | $44.42 9.70z - $41.10 6lcase 7.99/can No Bid EA1-9.70Z $5.95 No Bid LUEA $8.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
aerosol 6lcase
Rags, white cotton t-shirt 5 25#/bx No Bid $84.92 25lb Case $96.24 No Bid 25#/case 3.80each 25#bx $93.89 No Bid 254 box $68.40 204 ctn $35.00 254 box $51.99 No Bid BX/1000 $41.91 NoBid | 25IbBOX | $71.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanitary Napkin Dispenser liners, wall 7 500/cs No Bid $68.58 500/Carton $46.54 No Bid 500/case 053 each 500/cs $29.89 No Bid 500/case $42.05 500/case $27.40 500/cs $20.94 No Bid CT/500 $20.30 No Bid 500/CS $21.71 500/cs $39.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
mount units
Sanitary Napkin Dispenser liners, 3 No Bid no bid No Bid No Bid No Bid each $49.89 No Bid 250/case $39.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT/500 $34.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ling floor units
Sanitary Napkins 15 250/cs 250/cs $29.59 $274.57 250/Carton $45.68 No Bid 250/case .10 each 250/cs $68.89 No Bid 250/case $69.99 250/case $61.30 250/cs $43.98 No Bid CT/250 $45.26 No Bid 250/CS $46.29 #4 $95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Scouring Pad, green 6 x 9 8 10/pk $21.00 $51.15 10/pk $13.70 No Bid 520/case 014 each 10/pk $3.59 No Bid No Bid 10pk/box 2.20/pk 10/pk - 3.99/pk No Bid PK/10 $6.21 No Bid | 6/10PK/CS | $20.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60/cs 6oklcase
Scrub brush, long handled 36 No Bid $16.58 No Bid No Bid 6lcase 6.10each each $12.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12 ealcase 5.59 each No Bid EA/L $2.05 No Bid 1EA $5.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sponge, all purpose with scour back 18 Sipk 24fes $27.98 $20.72 No Bid No Bid 20/case .81 each 6/pk $4.59 No Bid No Bid 5/box 3.30/pk | 5pk - 8pkicase 3.10/pk No Bid EAL $2.38 No Bid 4/10/cs $37.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spray Buff (flooring) 20 gal No Bid $51.00 No Bid No Bid 4gallcase | 12.76 each 4l1gal $58.59 No Bid No Bid 4galicase | 10.25/gal No Bid No Bid CT/4-GAL | $86.34 NoBid | 4/1GL/CS | $56.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Swiffer Duster 10 10/box No Bid $61.49 10/Pk $16.17 No Bid 10/box 1.11 each 18/bx $16.59 No Bid No Bid 10/box 10.20/box 10/ - 7.99/box No Bid PK/10 $9.24 No Bid 10/8X $15.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6hxlcase
Swiffer Duster, Heavy Duty 10 6/box No Bid $13.74 6/bx $16.30 No Bid 6/box 1.89each | 11box/3box $49.89 No Bid No Bid Lhandle/3 | 68.70/case |6/bx-6bx/case| 7.69/box No Bid PK/6 $10.22 No Bid 6/BX. $15.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
case refills -
6lcase
Toilet tissue, 2 ply roll, 500 sheets 451 96 rlsics o6rilcs | $74.22 $109.91 500 $54.23 | 96/500 | $47.94 | 96rolls 153 each 96risics $44.59 NoBid |50 sheetsiroll | $50.20 | 96lcase | 41.24/case | 500/oll-96 | 57.98/case No Bid | CT/96-48,000 | $57.57 NoBid | 96RL/ICS | $50.00 235 $54.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sheets/Roll, case - 96 rolls/case rolls/case sheets
96 Rolls/Carton
Trash Liner, hi-molecular (Mobil 50 200/cs No Bid $56.53 No Bid No Bid 200/Case .21 each 200/case $34.90 100/case $36.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT /200 $32.33 No Bid No Bid | CP366022 | $26.80 200/Box $20.32 200/Box $17.32 | 200/Box | $17.32 200/Box | $17.32 | 200/Box | $17.32
36"x60", 56 gal)




Trash Liners, 10 micron, clear, 30x37 20 500/cs 250/cs $31.74 $77.37 500/cs $56.24 No Bid 500/ case .07 each 500/cs $27.89 500/case $34.90 500/case $23.00 500/case $15.90 No Bid No Bid CT /500 $32.16 No Bid 500/CS $36.09 | CP3037N10 | $24.00 500/Box $24.34 500/Box $21.48 500/Box $21.48 500/Box | $21.48 500/Box | $21.48
Trash Liners, 14 micron, clear, 43x48 52 500/cs 250/cs $50.15 $158.94 No Bid No Bid 200/case .015 each 200/cs $27.59 200/case $34.90 150/case $21.33 250/case $20.30 No Bid No Bid CT /250 $30.30 No Bid 200/CS $37.43 | CP4348N14 | $22.00 | Persample |$19.98/200 | Per sample | $17.98/200 | Per sample [ $16.72/200 | Per sample | $16.72/20 | Per sample | $16.72/20
$49.95/500 $44.95/500 $41.80/500 0 0
$41.80/50 $41.80/50
0 0
Trash Liners, 16 micron, clear, 33 gal., | 77 250/cs 250/cs $36.69 $62.21 250/Case $35.82 No Bid 250/case .12 each 250/cs $24.59 250/case $34.90 250/case $20.99 250/case $13.45 No Bid No Bid CT /250 $27.93 No Bid 250/CS $26.80 | CP3340N16 | $20.10 500/Box $17.78 500/Box $14.98 | 500/Box | $13.72 500/Box | $11.98 | 500/Box | $11.98
33x40
Trash Liners, 16 micron, clear, 60 gal., | 22 200/cs 200fcs | $51.34 $102.00 | 200/Case $64.36 NoBid | 200kcase | .22each 200/cs $3359 | 200/case | $37.50 200/case $24.26 | 200fcase | $24.45 No Bid No Bid CT/200 | $38.94 NoBid | 200/CS | $37.13 | CP3860N16 | $22.10 | 200/Box $28.82 | 200Box | $26.72 | 200/Box | $23.84 | 200/Box | $21.34 | 200/Box | $21.34
38x60
Trash Liners, 16 micron, clear, 56 gal., 5 200/cs 250/cs $50.15 $75.07 200/Case $56.24 No Bid 200/case .18 each 200/cs $26.59 200/case $37.50 200/case $21.97 200/case $19.50 No Bid No Bid CT /200 $37.85 No Bid 200/CS $42.99 | CP4348N16 | $28.00 200/Box $27.82 200/Box $25.84 | 200/Box | $23.24 200/Box | $20.72 | 200/Box | $20.72
43x48
Trash Liners, 3 ply super tuff, black, 55 { 15 100/cs 100fcs | $66.17 $73.07 No Bid 100 $20.07 | 100/case | .36 each 100/cs $77.89 | 100fcase | $39.50 100/case $52.90 | 100fcase | $27.90 No Bid No Bid CT/100 | $29.85 NoBid | NOBID |NO BID |CP3858KXH| $19.80 | 100/Box $21.98 | 100/Box | $2034 [ 100/Box [ $18.32 | 100/Box | $16.32 | 100/Box | $14.24
gal., 38x58
Trash Liners, 8 micron, clear, 12-16 36 1000/cs 1000/cs | $42.81 $89.02 1000/Case $59.99 No Bid | 1000/case .04 each 1000/cs, $29.89 1000/case $36.40 1000/case $21.08 1000/case $18.99 No Bid No Bid CT /1000 $34.54 NoBid [ 1000/CS | $46.76 | CP2433N8 | $22.00 | 1000/Box $23.82 | 1000/Box | $17.32 |1000/Box [ $17.32 [ 1000/Box | $17.32 | 1000/Box | $17.32
gal., 24x33
Trash Liners, 8 micron, clear, 7-10 gal., | 5 1000/cs 1000/cs | $32.95 $40.19 1000/Case | $62.49 NoBid | 1000/case | .028each | 1000fcs $31.89 | 1000/case | $29.50 | 1000/case | $19.05 | 1000fcase | $19.45 No Bid NoBid | CT/1000 | $29.40 NoBid | 1000/CS | $34.00 | CP2424N8 | $1500 | 1000/Box | $21.84 | 1000/Box | $16.32 |1000/Box | $16.32 | 1000/Box | $16.32 | 1000/Box | $16.32
24x24
Trash Liners, Blue, 1.2 mil thick, 5 100/CS No Bid | pack of 100, $46.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 100/case $74.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid CT /100 $104.30 No Bid No Bid |CP221658BX| $28.00 100/Box $33.82 100/Box $33.82 100/Box $33.82 100/Box | $33.82 100/Box | $33.82
22x16x58 (Aluf Plastics Blue Recyling) 33"x 39 H
Windshield Cleaner 3 6 gallcs No Bid $89.59 Each $45.77 No Bid No Bid 6 gallcs $24.89 NoBid | 1gal-6/case | $49.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid EA/L- GAL $4.98 | 1Lx4=Gallon | $69.50 | 6/1GL/CS | $33.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6/Gallon Case
Wipes, handi-wipe, 100/box 20 100/bx No Bid $12.69 100/Bx $8.20 No Bid 100/box .99 each 100/bx $17.89 NoBid | 100 canister $9.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid BX/1000 $8.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wipes, Clorox 75/canister 3 pack 5 75/canister No Bid $16.78 75/Canister, 3 [ $19.14 No Bid 75/ .09 each T75canister/ $15.59 No Bid | 75/canister-3| $23.61 | 75/canister -|  $22.00 75 canister - 5.59/can No Bid PKI3 $13.49 No Bid 6/75/CS $40.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Canisters/ Pack canister 3pack canister/case 6 canisters 3Ipkg
Ziplock bags, sandwich 10 300 box No Bid $15.68 500/Box $13.81 No Bid 500/box .04 each 500/box $18.59 No Bid 500/case $31.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid CT /500 $19.80 No Bid 500/CS $22.13 No Bid Sample - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Included but
no price on bid
Ziplock bags, gallon 46 250 box. No Bid 250/Box $26.75 No Bid 250/box .13 each 250/case No Bid 250/case $32.79 No Bid 250 box No Bid CT /250 No Bid 250/CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ziplock bags, quart 11 500 box No Bid 500/Box No Bid 500/box 85 each 500/cs No Bid 500/case $28.99 No Bid 500 box No Bid CT /500 No Bid [ 1000/CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




