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Whitney East x x x x x x $548,000.00 $31,000.00 $140,000.00 $38,000.00
Perma Column 

& Cloplay $767,000.00

Essential 

Construction x x x x x x $520,000.00 $36,000.00 $189,000.00 $18,000.00 Perma Column $773,000.00

Blue Heron x x x x x x $530,611.00 $55,000.00 $155,000.00 no bid no bid $750,611.00

Building Innovation x x x x x x $628,765.00 $32,886.00 $105,548.00 $0.00 no bid $777,199.00

Nichols Construction No x x x x x $557,400.00 $65,000.00 $164,500.00 $9,600.00 no bid $806,500.00

 2024-19 Hampton Corners Storage Building
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