BID FORM FOR BID# 2024-12
7/18/24 11:00AM

PLUMBING AND ELECTRICAL LCSO TRAINING COMPLEX CLASSROOM

Mark's Plumbing Cooper Electric
Vendor Parts D Booth Supply

Signed Bid Form X X X

Signed Non- Collusion X X X

Signed Appendix D X X X

ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty |Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price [ Total Price [Unit Price| Total Price
Section 1: Rough Plumbing
Type L Copper
2" x 10' 6 No Bid $176.65 | $1,059.88 | No Bid No Bid
11/2" x 10’ 2 No Bid $109.71 $219.41 No Bid No Bid
11/4" x 10’ 9 No Bid $86.13 $775.16 No Bid No Bid
1" x 10° 10 No Bid $74.44 $744.35 No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 10' 25 No Bid $44.35 | $1,108.83 | No Bid No Bid
1/2" x 10’ 6 No Bid $31.09 $186.56 No Bid No Bid
Propress Copper Fittings

2" Coupler 2 $24.64 $49.28 $18.63 $37.27 No Bid No Bid
1 1/4" Coupler 2 $10.60 $21.20 $8.01 $16.03 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Coupler 5 $4.14 $20.70 $3.13 $15.65 No Bid No Bid
1/2" Coupler 3 $2.74 $8.22 $2.07 $6.21 No Bid No Bid
2" Elbow 10 $51.79 $517.90 $39.17 $391.67 No Bid No Bid
1 1/4" Elbow 5 $19.72 $98.60 $14.91 $74.57 No Bid No Bid
1" Elbow 10 $9.77 $97.70 $7.39 $73.91 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Elbow 35 $4.90 $171.50 $3.71 $129.68 No Bid No Bid
1/2" Elbow 10 $3.04 $30.40 $2.30 $22.96 No Bid No Bid
1 1/4" x 1" Reducing Elbow 2 No Bid $23.53 $47.06 No Bid No Bid
1" x 3/4" Reducing Elbow 1 $16.97 $16.97 $13.80 $13.80 No Bid No Bid
1" x 1/2" Reducing Elbow 5 No Bid $13.69 $68.43 No Bid No Bid
2" x 1 1/2" Reducer 1 $36.13 $36.13 $27.32 $27.32 No Bid No Bid
2"x11/2"x11/4" Tee 1 $94.03 $94.03 $70.39 $70.39 No Bid No Bid
2" x 2" x 3/4" Tee 2 $69.67 $139.34 $52.69 $105.39 No Bid No Bid
11/2"x11/2" x 3/4" Tee 1 $42.82 $42.82 $32.38 $32.38 No Bid No Bid
11/2"11/4" x 3/4" Tee 1 $56.45 $56.45 $45.10 $45.10 No Bid No Bid
11/4" x 1 1/4" x 3/4" Tee 5 $23.17 $115.85 $17.52 $87.61 No Bid No Bid




11/4"x 1" x 3/4" Tee 2 $26.26 $52.52 $26.14 $52.28 No Bid No Bid
1"x 1" x 3/4" Tee 15 $16.87 $253.05 $12.76 $191.40 No Bid No Bid
1"x1"x 1/2" Tee 5 $17.30 $86.50 $13.08 $65.40 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Tee 5 $8.10 $40.50 $6.13 $30.64 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Female Adapter 5 $6.82 $34.10 $5.16 $25.78 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Hammer Arrester 5 No Bid $32.09 $160.43 No Bid No Bid
2" Ball Valve 5 $163.37 $816.85 $68.59 $342.96 No Bid No Bid
1" Ball Valve 5 $42.64 $213.20 $20.71 $103.53 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Ball Valve 20 $32.59 $651.80 $13.61 $272.24 No Bid No Bid
1/2" Ball Valve 5 $24.53 $122.65 $9.88 $49.41 No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 3/8" compression 90* Supply Valve 25 No Bid $19.71 $492.68 No Bid No Bid
1/2" x 3/8" Compression 90* Supply Valve 10 $24.40 $240.40 $10.24 $102.39 No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 12" Frost Proof Hose Bib 2 No Bid $54.77 $109.54 No Bid No Bid
Miscellaneous

50 Gallon Single Phase 230V Water Heater 1 No Bid $601.55 $601.55

3/8" Iron Hanger Plate 200 $3.18 $636.00 $0.59 $117.00 No Bid No Bid
3/8" x 6' Threaded Rod 20 $16.73 $334.60 $2.91 $58.12 No Bid No Bid
3/8" Nuts for Threaded Rod 400 $5.28 $2,112.00 $0.09 $34.80 No Bid No Bid
2" Copper Split Ring 20 No Bid $1.21 $24.18 No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Copper Split Ring 20 No Bid $1.05 $21.04 No Bid No Bid
1 1/4" Copper Split Ring 20 No Bid $0.94 $18.78 No Bid No Bid
1" Copper Split Ring 20 $4.38 $87.60 $0.89 $17.70 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Copper Split Ring 50 $3.63 $181.50 $0.79 $39.55 No Bid No Bid
1/2" Copper Split Ring 20 $3.08 $61.60 $0.68 $13.68 No Bid No Bid
2" Iron Split Ring 20 $5.68 $113.60 $1.30 $25.92 No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Iron Split Ring 20 $4.68 $93.60 $1.04 $20.76 No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 25' Plastic Pipe Strapping 5 No Bid $2.42 $12.12 No Bid No Bid
1 1/4" Mixing Valve 1 No Bid $906.12 | $906.12 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Circulating Pump 110V 1 No Bid $317.42 | $317.42 No Bid No Bid
1 1/4" Water Meter 1 No Bid NA NA No Bid No Bid
Single Handle Brass Shower only Valve 2 No Bid $42.33 $84.65 No Bid No Bid

Fiberglass Pipe Insulation 1" Thick

2" x 3' Sections 35 No Bid $6.76 $236.53 No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" x 3' Sections 15 No Bid $6.69 $100.28 No Bid No Bid
1 1/4" x 3' Sections 35 No Bid $5.81 $203.28 No Bid No Bid
1" x 3' Sections 60 No Bid $5.74 $344.10 No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 3' Sections 100 No Bid $5.33 $533.30 No Bid No Bid




1/2" x 3' Sections 35 No Bid $4.90 $171.33 No Bid No Bid
#10 90* Elbow 5 No Bid $2.65 $13.27 No Bid No Bid
#9  90* Elbow 10 No Bid $2.11 $21.07 No Bid No Bid
#7  90* Elbow 35 No Bid $1.64 $57.54 No Bid No Bid
#10 Tee 5 No Bid $4.29 $21.47 No Bid No Bid
#9 Tee 10 No Bid $3.64 $36.35 No Bid No Bid
#7 Tee 35 No Bid $2.79 $97.58 No Bid No Bid
Bid Total for Rough Plumbing $7,649.16 $11,507.81
Awarded to:[ID Booth
Section #2: Rough Electrical
Wire Qty.
600 kemil 3 cut 380’ $7,581.00 | $22,743.00 | $5,700.00 | $17,100.00
#1 Copper 3 cut 330' $825.53 | $2,476.58 | $660.00 | $1,980.00
#6 Ground Coated 330' $305.68 | $305.68 | $257.40 | $257.40
500 kemil 3 cut 100' $1,707.30 | $5,121.90 | $1,090.00| $1,090.00
#1 Coated Copper Ground 100" $167.44 $167.44 $200.00 $200.00
#4 Bare Copper Ground 130' $169.51 $169.51 | $130.00 [ $130.00
#4 Coated Copper Ground 15' $21.24 $21.24 $18.00 $18.00
#12 Wire Black 30' 2 $6.37 $12.74 $85.00 $170.00
#14 Wire Blue 100' 1 $13.69 $13.69 $57.50 $57.50
#14 Wire Yellow 100' 1 $13.69 $13.69 $57.50 $57.50
#10 100' Black 2 $32.45 $64.90 $132.50 | $132.50
#10 100' White 2 $32.45 $64.90 $132.50 | $132.50
#10 100' Green 1 $32.45 $32.45 $132.50 | $132.50
#8 500' Black 1 $300.90 $300.90 $240.00 $240.00
#8 500' White 1 $300.90 $300.90 | $240.00 | $240.00
#8 500' Green 1 $300.90 $300.90 $240.00 $240.00
#10 500' Black 1 $162.25 | $162.25 | $132.50 | $132.50
#10 500'Red 1 $162.25 $162.25 $132.50 $132.50
#10 500' Green 1 $162.25 | $162.25 | $132.50 | $132.50
#10 1000' Black 1 $324.50 $324.50 $132.50 $265.00
#10 1000' White 1 $32450 | $32450 | $132.50 | $265.00
#10 1000' Green 1 $324.50 $324.50 $132.50 $265.00
#12 Thhn 250'Roll Black 5 $53.10 $265.50 $85.00 $255.00
#12 Thhn 250'Roll White 4 $53.10 $212.40 $85.00 $170.00
#12 Thhn 250'Roll Green 3 $53.10 $159.30 $85.00 $85.00
12-2 MC 1000' Rolls 2 $719.80 | $1,439.60 | $600.00 | $1,200.00




12-3 MC 250' Rolls 2 $338.70 | $677.39 | $275.00 [ $550.00
Cat6 1000' Box/roll 6 $719.80 $936.12 $227.00 | $1,362.00
Panels
120/240 Single Phase 225 Amp 42 Space Panel 2 $208.82 $417.64 | $185.00 [ $370.00
400 Amp Main Disconnect 1 $465.83 $465.83 | $1,055.00 [ $1,055.00
24" x 24" J Box Enclosure 1 $103.06 | $103.06 $96.00 $96.00
12" x 12" J Box Enclosure 2 $24.07 $48.13 $17.00 $34.00
Breakers
20 Amp Single 40 $10.78 $431.00 $4.84 $193.00
35 Amp Single 1 $15.24 $15.24 $8.52 $8.52
20 Amp Double 4 $23.58 $94.32 $11.80 $47.50
30 Amp Double 1 $23.58 $23.58 $11.80 $11.80
40 Amp Double 2 $23.58 $47.16 $11.80 $23.60
125 Amp Double 1 $214.36 | $214.36 | $113.00 | $113.00
Conduit
3" EMT x 10' 5 $92.64 $463.20 $69.00 $345.00
3" EMT Coupling 20 $5.08 $101.58 $4.00 $80.00
3" EMT Connector Bushing and Nut 10 $7.87 $78.69 $6.13 $61.30
3"EMT 90 4 $57.95 $231.79 $56.00 $224.00
3"EMT 45 4 $54.89 $219.55 $56.00 $224.00
2" EMT x 10' 20 $48.15 $962.96 $38.00 $760.00
2" EMT Coupling 40 $1.98 $79.28 $1.70 $68.00
2" EMT Connector Bushing and Nut 20 $2.32 $46.34 $2.10 $42.00
2"EMT 90 8 $17.83 $142.65 $16.75 $134.00
2"EMT 45 8 $16.98 $135.86 $16.75 $134.00
1" EMT x 10' 50 $20.72 | $1,036.10 | $16.70 $835.00
1" EMT Coupler 50 $0.57 $28.60 $0.45 $22.50
1" EMTConnector Bushing and Nut 30 $0.81 $24.36 $0.60 $18.00
3/4" EMT x 10' 100 $12.07 | $1,206.75 $9.50 $950.00
3/4" EMT Coupler 200 $0.33 $65.00 $0.29 $58.00
3/4" EMT Connector Bushing and Nut 200 $0.51 $101.00 $0.29 $58.00
3/4" EMT Push on Bushing 100 $0.15 $14.75 $0.15 $15.00
3/4" EMT to Rigid 100 $0.39 $38.80 $37.00 $370.00
Boxes

4" Square 120 $2.13 $255.24 $1.95 $234.00
4" Sq. 5/8" Mud Ring Double 30 $1.57 $47.07 $1.38 $41.40
4" Sq. 5/8" Mud Ring Single 80 $1.02 $81.84 $0.75 $60.00




4" Sq. Box Covers 20 $0.63 $12.60 $0.50 $10.00
4" Octogon 6 $24.32 $145.92 $1.62 $9.72
Misc
1/2" MC Snap in Connector Single 100 $0.90 $89.70 $0.72 $72.00
1/2" MC Snap in Connector Double 100 $1.97 $197.20 $1.20 $120.00
Ground Pigtails w/ Screws 200 $0.71 $141.20 $0.60 $120.00
J Hooks for Cat6 100 $3.06 $306.00 $3.95 $395.00
3/8" x 6' Threaded Rod 48 $3.58 $171.94 $2.46 $118.08
3/8" Nuts 400 $0.11 $44.40 $6.92 $27.68
3/8" Washers 200 $0.09 $17.80 $8.07 $16.14
3/8" Sammy for Wood 200 $0.68 $135.00 $55.00 $110.00
10' x 1 1/2" Kindorf 20 $59.47 | $1,189.46 | $18.60 $372.00
1" Kindorf Strap 200 $2.70 $540.80 $0.67 $134.00
3/4" Kindorf Strap 100 $2.22 $222.20 $0.62 $62.00
Bid Total for Rough Electrical $47,696.93 $35,245.64
Bid form states total at
$37,255.91

Awarded to:

No Award.




