BID FORM FOR BID# 2024-8
5/22/24 11:00AM
BUILDING MATERIALS LCSO TRAINING FACILITY CLASSROOM

Nunda Lumber Rogers & Tenbrooks
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty Unit Price | Total Price Notes Unit Price | Total Price Notes
LUMBER
Dimensional Lumber
2x4x8' 20 $4.20 $84.00 $3.90 $78.00
2x4x10' 10 $4.90 $49.00 $4.75 $47.50
2x4x12' 350 $5.48| $1,918.00 $6.00[ $2,100.00
2x4x16' 100 $8.94 $894.00 $8.90 $890.00
2X6Xx8' 10 $6.20 $62.00 $5.90 $59.00
2x6x10' 10 $8.25 $82.50 $7.45 $74.50
2x6x12' 400 $9.59[ $3,836.00 $8.80[ $3,520.00
2X6x16' 10 $12.99 $129.90 $11.70 $117.00
2x8x8' 20 $8.60 $172.00 $9.30 $186.00
2x8x10' 5 $10.85 $54.25 $11.65 $58.25
2x8x12' 12 $13.10 $157.20 $13.40 $160.80
2x10x8' 20 $10.60 $212.00 $12.75 $255.00
2x10x10' 8 $13.67 $109.36 $15.95 $127.60
2x10x12' 2 $16.86 $33.72 $19.20 $38.40
2x12x8' 2 $16.90 $33.80 $16.50 $33.00
2x12x12' 2 $24.25 $48.50 $26.00 $52.00
1x4x8' 10 $6.25 $62.50 $7.00 $70.00
1x4x10' 10 $7.90 $79.00 $8.80 $88.00
1x4x12' 6 $9.70 $58.20 $10.60 $63.60
1x4x16' 2 $12.80 $25.60 $14.10 $28.20
1x6x8' 2 $10.05 $20.10 $11.20 $22.40
1x6x10' 2 $12.70 $25.40 $14.00 $28.00
1x6x12' 25 $15.49 $387.25 $16.80 $420.00
1x6x16' 2 $20.60 $41.20 $22.40 $44.80
1x8x8' 2 $12.50 $25.00 $15.20 $30.40
1x8x12' 10 $19.50 $195.00 $22.80 $228.00
1x8x16' 2 $25.50 $51.00 $30.40 $60.80




1x10x8' 2 $18.30 $36.60 $16.80 $33.60
1x10x12' 15 $27.40 $411.00 $25.20 $378.00
1x10x16' 2 $36.40 $72.80 $33.60 $67.20
5/4x4x8' 2 $11.90 $23.80 $14.80 $29.60
5/4 4x10' 4 $17.98 $71.92 $18.50 $74.00
5/4x4x12' 2 $17.98 $35.96 $22.20 $44.40
5/4x6x8' 2 $20.30 $40.60 $22.00 $44.00
5/4x6x10' 4 $27.40 $109.60 $27.50 $110.00
5/4x6x12' 2 $27.40 $54.80 $33.00 $66.00
Hardwood Lumber
2" x 2" x 16" Oak 60 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Sheet Goods
1/2" CDX 125 $26.00| $3,250.00 $26.00| $3,250.00
5/8 CDX 140 $27.80| $3,892.00 $27.50( $3,850.00
1/2" OSB 125 $20.70| $2,587.50 $18.45| $2,306.25
5/8" T&G OSB 140 $22.40| $3,136.00 $25.75| $3,605.00
2" x 48" x 96" R10 Foam Board
Insulation 30 $59.30| $1,779.00 $50.00( $1,500.00
24" x 0.60" FRP Foundation
Protection Board 30 |NoBid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Nail Base Panel System
R22.3 4" composite insulation with
7/16" OSB sheathing 110 |NoBid $0.00 $175.00| $19,250.00
enough
Fasteners (to accompany above for 110
sheathing) panels [No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Pressure Treated Lumber
2x4x8' 2 $6.10 $12.20 $6.35 $12.70
2x4x10' 2 $7.30 $14.60 $7.25 $14.50
2x4x12' 20 $8.70 $174.00 $8.60 $172.00
2x4x16' 2 $11.10 $22.20 $12.55 $25.10
2X6Xx8' 2 $8.40 $16.80 $9.20 $18.40
2x6x10' 2 $10.60 $21.20 $11.10 $22.20
$324.96 Was listed in the
2X6x12' 24 $12.40 $297.60 $13.45 $322.80|bid




2X6x16' 2 $16.10 $32.20 $15.20 $30.40
2x8x8' 8 $11.10 $88.80 $10.10 $80.80
2x8x12' 2 $15.60 $31.20 $15.30 $30.60
2x8x16' 2 $20.30 $40.60 $20.60 $41.20
4x4x8' 1 $12.86 $12.86 $12.30 $12.30
4x4x12' 1 $17.90 $17.90 $19.95 $19.95
4x8x8' 3 $17.59 $52.77 No Bid $0.00
4x8x16' 1 $35.50 $35.50 $92.75 $278.25
6X6x8' 2 $26.28 $52.56 $28.35 $56.70
6x6x12' 8 $42.50 $340.00 $47.50 $380.00
2x6x12' T&G 5 $13.95 $69.75 $15.00 $75.00
Fasteners and Hardware
5/8" x 8" Carriage Bolts 10 $3.50 $35.00 $3.19 $31.90
5/8" x 6" Carriage Bolts 16 $2.90 $46.40 $2.35 $37.60
1/4" x 3" Tapcon 150 $0.25 $37.50 $0.50 $75.00
1/4" Masonary Bit 3 $4.29 $12.87 $4.99 $14.97
Simpson StrongTie Column Cap
Bracket 6" column x 4" beam 2 $19.99 $39.98 $18.75 $37.50
Hurricane Clips 500 $1.00 $500.00 $0.70 $350.00
25# Box 3" Exterior Screws 12 $86.00| $1,032.00 $109.95| $1,319.40
Box Pneumatic 16d Framing Nails 3 $55.00 $165.00 $47.00 $141.00
Box Pneumatic 8d Sheeting Nails 4 $34.00 $136.00 $46.25 $185.00
8" Sill Seal 5 $13.90 $69.50 $10.95 $54.75
Foam Insulation Adhesive 12 $11.99 $143.88 $5.29 $63.48
Tyvek House Wrap 9' x 150 2 $290.00 $580.00 $285.00 $570.00
Tyvek House Wrap 3' x 100' 2 $68.00 $136.00 $58.75 $117.50
Box Arrow 5/16" Staples 10 $4.79 $47.90 $4.50 $45.00
Tyvek Tape 3 $19.99 $59.97 $19.49 $58.47
Window Flashing Tape 6" Wide 300’ $28.99 $115.96 $52.00 $156.00
11' Pull Down Attic Access Ladder 1 $1,250.00f $1,250.00 $299.99 $299.99
Concrete Mix 2 $6.39 $12.78 $6.50 $13.00
AWARDED
TO NUNDA $48,656.94 is the total on
Lumber Bid Total $30,101.54 LUMBER $48,652.76 the submitted bid

Electrical Service & Underground |




4" x 10' 70 $79.99| $5,599.30 No bid
4" 90* Sweep 12 $41.99 $503.88 No bid
4" 45* Sweep 6 $40.99 $245.94 No bid
4" 22.5* 6 No Bid No bid
4" Coupler 60 $5.99 $359.40 No bid
4" Expansion Coupler 6 $139.99 $839.94 No bid
4" TA w/ nut and bushing 7 $15.99 $111.93 No bid
21/2" x 10' 130 $53.99| $7,018.70 $54.99 $7,148.70
2 1/2" 90* Sweep 10 $13.99 $139.90 $28.49 $284.90
2 1/2" 45* Sweep 3 $14.99 $44.97 $16.49 $49.47
2 1/2" Coupler 40 $2.39 $95.60 $4.49 $179.60
2 1/2" TA w/ nut and bushing 4 $7.49 $29.96 No bid
2" x 10’ 50 $39.99| $1,999.50 $27.49] $1,374.50
2" 90* Sweep 18 $15.19 $273.42 $6.79 $122.22
2" 45* Sweep 2 $7.59 $15.18 $7.59 $15.18
2" 22.5* 2 No Bid No bid
2" TA w/ nut and bushing 7 $7.39 $51.73 2.89/2.39 $36.96
1" x 10’ 110 $17.99] $1,978.90 $12.99 $1,428.90
1" 90* Sweep 21 $5.49 $115.29 $4.19 $87.99
1" 45* Sweep 30 $2.99 $89.70 $2.59 $77.70
1" Coupler 4 $1.69 $6.76 $1.19 $4.76
1" TA w/ nut and bushing 3 $3.99 $11.97 1.19/1.69 $8.64
Miscellaneous - Electrical
4" x 10' Rigid 3 $611.99( $1,835.97 No bid
4" Rigid 90* Sweep 3 $120.99 $362.97 No bid
4" Rigid Coupler 6 $25.99 $155.94 No bid
4" Rigid TA 6 $43.99 $263.94 No bid
Galv. Ground Rods 14 $18.99 $265.86 $16.49 $230.86
Ground Clamps 14 $8.19 $114.66 $4.49 $62.86
Mule Tape 1000’ Roll 3 $287.59 $862.77 No bid
PVC Glue Clear 20 $21.49 $429.80 $17.49 $349.80
3' x3' Precast Box 3 $537.39| $1,612.17 No bid
1' x1' Precast Box 3 $110.99 $332.97 No bid
4" Strap Clamp 10 $2.79 $27.90 No bid

Panels




400 Amp Fused Disconnect 1 $2,180.99| $2,180.99 $3,827.85
Automatic Transfer Switch 1 $4,072.99] $4,072.99 No bid
100 Amp NEMA 3R Single Phase
Panel 1 $134.99 $134.99 $1,279.62
400 Amp Meter Socket 1 $678.99 $678.99 $3,440.22
400 amp NEMA 3R Knife Switch 1 $2,180.99| $2,180.99 $3,635.23
AWARDED
TO NUNDA
Electrical Bid Total $35,045.87 LUMBER $23,645.96
Plumbing
PVC Sch. 40 Pipe
10' of 6" Sch. 40 2 $99.99 $199.98 $99.99 $199.98
10" of 4" Sch. 40 15 $49.99 $749.85 $37.99 $569.85
10' of 3" Sch. 40 11 $43.99 $483.89 $25.99 $285.89
10' of 2" Sch. 40 20 $24.19 $483.80 $16.99 $339.80
10' of 1 1/2" Sch. 40 20 $19.99 $399.80 $11.99 $239.80
PVC Sch. 40 Fittings
6" 45 Elbow 2 $39.99 $79.98 $39.99 $79.98
6" 45 Street Elbow 2 $43.49 $86.98 No Bid
4" 90 Elbow 10 $15.99 $159.90 $14.99 $149.90
4" Couplings 10 $7.99 $79.90 $5.99 $59.90
4" Wye 10 $30.19 $301.90 $24.99 $249.90
4" Double Wye 5 $77.49 $387.45 $52.99 $264.95
4" x 4" x 3" Wye 10 $25.99 $259.90 $17.99 $179.90
4" x 4" x 2" Wye 10 $17.99 $179.90 $17.99 $179.90
4" x 2" Bushing 5 $26.19 $130.95 $12.99 $64.95
4" x 1 1/2" Bushing 15 $23.99 $359.85 No Bid
4" 45 Elbow 15 $16.49 $247.35 $12.49 $187.35
4" 45 Street Elbow 20 $15.79 $315.80 $11.99 $239.80
4" Floor Cleanout 3 $23.99 $71.97 $17.99 $53.97
4" Floor Drain w/ Bronze Screen 4 $19.99 $79.96 No Bid
4" Floor Drain w/ Stainless Steel
Screen 2 $19.99 $39.98 No Bid
4" Running Trap 6 No Bid No Bid
3" 90 Elbow 10 $9.49 $94.90 $7.69 $76.90




3" 45 Elbow 10 $6.99 $69.90 $6.99 $69.90
3" 45 Street Elbow 20 $11.99 $239.80 $7.19 $143.80
3" Wye 20 $19.99 $399.80 $14.99 $299.80
3" Couplers 10 $4.69 $46.90 $3.69 $36.90
3" x 1 1/2" Bushing 15 $12.99 $194.85 $7.59 $113.85
3" Toilet Flange 5 $16.79 $83.95 $9.99 $49.95
2" Wye 10 $11.19 $111.90 $5.99 $59.90
2" 45 Elbow 15 $2.99 $44.85 $2.29 $34.35
2" 45 Street Elbow 20 $5.19 $103.80 $2.79 $55.80
2" x 1 1/2" Coupler 12 $5.79 $69.48 $2.29 $27.48
2" Coupler 10 $1.49 $14.90 $1.29 $12.90
2" x 2" x 3" Tee 1 $11.79 $11.79 No Bid
2" x 1 1/2" Bushing 20 $1.79 $35.80 $1.99 $39.80
2" x 2" x 1 1/2" Tee 10 $8.79 $87.90 $2.99 $29.90
11/2" 90 Elbow 20 $2.49 $49.80 $1.69 $33.80
11/2" Tee 10 $5.99 $59.90 $3.39 $33.90
Miscellaneous Plumbing
2" x 4' Trench Drain 2 $54.99 $109.98 No Bid
Glue 3 $21.49 $64.47 $18.99 $56.97
Cleaner 3 $12.79 $38.37 $14.99 $44.97
AWARDED TO ROGERS
Plumbing Total $7,032.13 $4,566.69 & TENBROOK
Trusses
46' 6" Truss, 24" OC, 2' 5" Overhang
With A 7 1/4" Heel 38
46' 6" Gable End Truss to Match 2
Load Specs and Bracing Sheet 1
Package Price -
AWARDED TO ROGERS
Truss Total $15,315.00 Package Price $11,090.00 & TENBROOK
Total Bid $87,494.54 $87,955.41

Notes




